LegiList
Congress, Made Clear.
Bill Fact Sheet — December 11, 2025
https://legilist.com
Bill page: https://legilist.com/bill/109/hres/517

HRES 517

Recognizing the life of Wellington Timothy Mara and his outstanding contributions to the New York Giants
Football Club, the National Football League, and the United States.

Congress: 109 (2005-2007, Ended)

Chamber: House

Policy Area: Commemorations

Introduced: Oct 26, 2005

Current Status: Mr. Issa asked unanimous consent that H. Res. 517 be amended as follows: in the first Resolved claus
Latest Action: Mr. Issa asked unanimous consent that H. Res. 517 be amended as follows: in the first Resolved clause,
strike '61 years' and insert in lieu thereof '51 years'. Agreed to without objection. (Jun 6, 2006)

Official Text: https://www.congress.gov/bill/109th-congress/house-resolution/517

Sponsor

Name: Rep. Pascrell, Bill, Jr. [D-NJ-8]
Party: Democratic * State: NJ ¢ Chamber: House


https://legilist.com
https://legilist.com/bill/109/hres/517
https://www.congress.gov/bill/109th-congress/house-resolution/517
https://legilist.com/legislator/P000096

Cosponsors (55 total)

Cosponsor Party / State Role Date Joined
Rep. Ferguson, Mike [R-NJ-7] R -NJ Oct 26, 2005
Rep. Lowey, Nita M. [D-NY-18] D - NY Oct 26, 2005
Rep. McCarthy, Carolyn [D-NY-4] D - NY Oct 26, 2005
Rep. Pallone, Frank, Jr. [D-NJ-6] D-NJ Oct 26, 2005
Rep. Serrano, Jose E. [D-NY-16] D - NY Oct 26, 2005
Rep. Bishop, Timothy H. [D-NY-1] D - NY Oct 27, 2005
Rep. Fossella, Vito [R-NY-13] R - NY Oct 27, 2005
Rep. King, Peter T. [R-NY-3] R - NY Oct 27, 2005
Rep. Rothman, Steven R. [D-NJ-9] D-NJ Oct 27, 2005
Rep. Kolbe, Jim [R-AZ-8] R-AZ Nov 1, 2005
Rep. McNulty, Michael R. [D-NY-21] D - NY Nov 1, 2005
Rep. Rangel, Charles B. [D-NY-15] D - NY Nov 1, 2005
Rep. Shays, Christopher [R-CT-4] R-CT Nov 1, 2005
Rep. Sweeney, John E. [R-NY-20] R - NY Nov 1, 2005
Rep. Walsh, James T. [R-NY-25] R - NY Nov 1, 2005
Rep. Brady, Robert A. [D-PA-1] D - PA Nov 2, 2005
Rep. Capuano, Michael E. [D-MA-8] D -MA Nov 2, 2005
Rep. Nadler, Jerrold [D-NY-8] D - NY Nov 2, 2005
Rep. Oberstar, James L. [D-MN-8] D - MN Nov 2, 2005
Rep. Boehlert, Sherwood [R-NY-24] R - NY Nov 3, 2005
Rep. Meeks, Gregory W. [D-NY-6] D - NY Nov 3, 2005
Rep. Smith, Adam [D-WA-9] D - WA Nov 3, 2005
Rep. Ackerman, Gary L. [D-NY-5] D - NY Nov 9, 2005
Rep. Holt, Rush [D-NJ-12] D-NJ Nov 9, 2005
Rep. Kuhl, John R. "Randy", Jr. [R-NY-29] R - NY Nov 9, 2005
Rep. Menendez, Robert [D-NJ-13] D-NJ Nov 10, 2005
Rep. Towns, Edolphus [D-NY-10] D - NY Nov 10, 2005
Rep. Hinchey, Maurice D. [D-NY-22] D - NY Nov 15, 2005
Rep. Maloney, Carolyn B. [D-NY-14] D - NY Nov 18, 2005
Rep. Weiner, Anthony D. [D-NY-9] D - NY Nov 18, 2005
Rep. Andrews, Robert E. [D-NJ-1] D-NJ Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Crowley, Joseph [D-NY-7] D - NY Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Delauro, Rosa L. [D-CT-3] D-CT Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Doyle, Michael F. [D-PA-14] D - PA Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Engel, Eliot L. [D-NY-17] D - NY Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Etheridge, Bob [D-NC-2] D-NC Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Evans, Lane [D-IL-17] D-IL Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Garrett, Scott [R-NJ-5] R-NJ Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Holden, Tim [D-PA-17] D - PA Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Israel, Steve [D-NY-2] D - NY Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Kelly, Sue W. [R-NY-19] R - NY Dec 6, 2005


https://legilist.com/legislator/F000443
https://legilist.com/legislator/L000480
https://legilist.com/legislator/M000309
https://legilist.com/legislator/P000034
https://legilist.com/legislator/S000248
https://legilist.com/legislator/B001242
https://legilist.com/legislator/F000440
https://legilist.com/legislator/K000210
https://legilist.com/legislator/R000462
https://legilist.com/legislator/K000306
https://legilist.com/legislator/M000590
https://legilist.com/legislator/R000053
https://legilist.com/legislator/S001144
https://legilist.com/legislator/S001149
https://legilist.com/legislator/W000099
https://legilist.com/legislator/B001227
https://legilist.com/legislator/C001037
https://legilist.com/legislator/N000002
https://legilist.com/legislator/O000006
https://legilist.com/legislator/B000586
https://legilist.com/legislator/M001137
https://legilist.com/legislator/S000510
https://legilist.com/legislator/A000022
https://legilist.com/legislator/H001032
https://legilist.com/legislator/K000364
https://legilist.com/legislator/M000639
https://legilist.com/legislator/T000326
https://legilist.com/legislator/H000627
https://legilist.com/legislator/M000087
https://legilist.com/legislator/W000792
https://legilist.com/legislator/A000210
https://legilist.com/legislator/C001038
https://legilist.com/legislator/D000216
https://legilist.com/legislator/D000482
https://legilist.com/legislator/E000179
https://legilist.com/legislator/E000226
https://legilist.com/legislator/E000250
https://legilist.com/legislator/G000548
https://legilist.com/legislator/H000712
https://legilist.com/legislator/I000057
https://legilist.com/legislator/K000078

Cosponsor Party / State Role Date Joined

Rep. Kind, Ron [D-WI-3] D-WI Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Langevin, James R. [D-RI-2] DRI Dec 6, 2005
Rep. LoBiondo, Frank A. [R-NJ-2] R -NJ Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Michaud, Michael H. [D-ME-2] D - ME Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Owens, Major R. [D-NY-11] D - NY Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Payne, Donald M. [D-NJ-10] D-NJ Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Ryan, Tim [D-OH-17] D-OH Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Saxton, Jim [R-NJ-3] R -NJ Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Smith, Christopher H. [R-NJ-4] R -NJ Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Taylor, Gene [D-MS-4] D -MS Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Velazquez, Nydia M. [D-NY-12] D - NY Dec 6, 2005
Rep. Higgins, Brian [D-NY-27] D - NY Dec 8, 2005
Rep. Wexler, Robert [D-FL-19] D-FL Dec 8, 2005
Rep. Carson, Julia [D-IN-7] D-IN Dec 16, 2005
Committee Activity

Committee Chamber Activity Date
Oversight and Government Reform Committee House Markup By Mar 9, 2006

Subjects & Policy Tags
Policy Area:

Commemorations

Related Bills
No related bills are listed.
Summary (as of Mar 28, 2006)

(This measure has not been amended since it was introduced. The summary of that version is repeated here.)

Recognizes the life of Wellington Timothy Mara and his contributions to the New York Giants, the National Football
League, and the United States.


https://legilist.com/legislator/K000188
https://legilist.com/legislator/L000559
https://legilist.com/legislator/L000554
https://legilist.com/legislator/M001149
https://legilist.com/legislator/O000159
https://legilist.com/legislator/P000149
https://legilist.com/legislator/R000577
https://legilist.com/legislator/S000097
https://legilist.com/legislator/S000522
https://legilist.com/legislator/T000074
https://legilist.com/legislator/V000081
https://legilist.com/legislator/H001038
https://legilist.com/legislator/W000314
https://legilist.com/legislator/C000191

Actions Timeline

e Jun 6, 2006: Mr. Issa asked unanimous consent that H. Res. 517 be amended as follows: in the first Resolved clause,
strike '61 years' and insert in lieu thereof '51 years'. Agreed to without objection.

e Mar 28, 2006: Mr. Dent moved to suspend the rules and agree to the resolution.
e Mar 28, 2006: Considered under suspension of the rules. (consideration: CR H1142-1144)
e Mar 28, 2006: DEBATE - The House proceeded with forty minutes of debate on H. Res. 517.

e Mar 28, 2006: Passed/agreed to in House: On motion to suspend the rules and agree to the resolution Agreed to by
voice vote.(text: CR H1142-1143)

e Mar 28, 2006: On motion to suspend the rules and agree to the resolution Agreed to by voice vote. (text: CR H1142-
1143)

e Mar 28, 2006: Motion to reconsider laid on the table Agreed to without objection.
e Mar 9, 2006: Committee Consideration and Mark-up Session Held.

e Mar 9, 2006: Ordered to be Reported (Amended) by Unanimous Consent.

e Oct 27, 2005: Sponsor introductory remarks on measure. (CR E2187)

e Oct 26, 2005: Introduced in House

e Oct 26, 2005: Introduced in House

e Oct 26, 2005: Referred to the House Committee on Government Reform.

Generated by LegiList — https://legilist.com - Public data belongs to the public.


https://legilist.com

